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A Valentine's Day story about finding your own special sweetheart.

Tomorrow is February 14th and Hippo is looking for a valentine, but all of the animals she asks-Leopard,
Dolphin, Butterfly, Elephant and more-give reasons as to why they aren't good matches for her. Will Hippo
have to celebrate Valentine's Day alone?

Jerry Pallotta and David Biedrzycki team up again in this humorous story that's as giggle-inducing as their
previous holiday offerings!
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From reader reviews:

Georgette Tang:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect with the internet
and the resources inside it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each information they get. How
many people to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book.
Reading through a book can help folks out of this uncertainty Information specially this Who Will Be My
Valentine This Year? book because book offers you rich details and knowledge. Of course the data in this
book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Lena Drew:

Does one one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Attempt to
pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its include may doesn't work is
difficult job because you are scared that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the outside seem likes.
Maybe you answer might be Who Will Be My Valentine This Year? why because the fantastic cover that
make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint you. The inside or content will be fantastic as
the outside or cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Frank Jorge:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The fitness of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. The book that recommended for you
is Who Will Be My Valentine This Year? this publication consist a lot of the information on the condition of
this world now. This kind of book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The words styles that
writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some analysis when he makes this
book. Here is why this book suited all of you.

Stella Carpenter:

You may get this Who Will Be My Valentine This Year? by check out the bookstore or Mall. Only viewing
or reviewing it might to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this reserve
are various. Not only simply by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by means of e-
book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking by your local mobile phone and searching what your
problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your guide. It is most important
to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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