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The creative writing teacher, the delivery guy, the local Starbucks baristas, his best friend, her roommate,
and the squirrel in the park all have one thing in common—they believe that Gabe and Lea should get
together.

Lea and Gabe are in the same creative writing class. They get the same pop culture references, order the
same Chinese food, and hang out in the same places. Unfortunately, Lea is reserved, Gabe has issues, and
despite their initial mutual crush, it looks like they are never going to work things out.

But somehow even when nothing is going on, something is happening between them, and everyone can see
it. You'll be rooting for Gabe and Lea too, in Sandy Hall's quirky, completely original novel A Little
Something Different, chosen by readers, writes, and publishers, to be the debut titles for the new Swoon
Reads imprint!
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From reader reviews:

John Dearman:

Book is usually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. We all know that that book is important issue to bring us around the
world. Close to that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A reserve A Little Something Different,
Chapter Sampler will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know
about almost everything. But some of you think in which open or reading the book make you bored. It's not
make you fun. Why they could be thought like that? Have you seeking best book or appropriate book with
you?

Rudy Nixon:

Reading a book to be new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to read a book. When you
examine a book you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge,
mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts
of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you want to entertain yourself read a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and soon. The A
Little Something Different, Chapter Sampler will give you new experience in reading a book.

Rita Merritt:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This A Little Something Different,
Chapter Sampler can be the reply, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are so out of date, spending
your spare time by reading in this new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the
others?

Jimmy Dolce:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is composed or printed or descriptive from each source which filled update of
news. Within this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From
media social similar to newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
looking for the A Little Something Different, Chapter Sampler when you desired it?
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