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Pretty much every poet in every age has written about death and dying. Along with love, it might be the most
popular subject in poetry. Yet, until now, no anthology has gathered the best and most famous of these verses
in one place.

This collection ranges dramatically. With more than 320 poems, it goes across all of history, from the
ancients straight through to today. Across countries and languages, across schools of poetry. You'll find a
plethora of approaches--witty, humorous, deadly serious, tear-jerking, wise, profound, angry, spiritual,
atheistic, uncertain, highly personal, political, mythic, earthy, and only occasionally morbid.

Every angle you can think of is covered--the deaths of children, lost loves, funeral rites, close calls, eating
meat, serial killers, the death penalty, roadkill, the Underworld, reincarnation, elegies for famous people,
death as an equalizer, death as a junk man, death as a child, the death of God, the death of death . . . .

You'll find death poetry's greatest hits, including:

"Because I Could Not Stop for Death" by Emily Dickinson●

"To an Athlete Dying Young" by A.E. Housman●

"Do not go gentle into that good night" by Dylan Thomas●

"When Lilacs Last in the Dooryard Bloom'd" by Walt Whitman●

"Annabel Lee" by Edgar Allan Poe●

The rest of the band includes . . .
Jane Austen, Mary Jo Bang, Willis Barnstone, Charles Baudelaire, William Blake, Charlotte Brontë, Lord
Byron, Lucille Clifton, Andrei Codrescu, Wanda Coleman, Billy Collins, Ralph Waldo Emerson, T.S. Eliot,
Nick Flynn, Benjamin Franklin, Robert Frost, Kimiko Hahn, Homer, Victor Hugo, Langston Hughes, James
Joyce, C.S. Lewis, Amy Lowell, W.S. Merwin, Edna St. Vincent Millay, Pablo Neruda, Thich Nhat Hanh,
Friedrich Nietzsche, Wilfred Owen, Rainer Maria Rilke, Christina Rossetti, Rumi, Sappho, Shakespeare,
Wallace Stevens, Ruth Stone, Wislawa Szymborska, W.B. Yeats, and a few hundred more.
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From reader reviews:

Karen Shiner:

Within other case, little folks like to read book Death Poems: Classic, Contemporary, Witty, Serious, Tear-
Jerking, Wise, Profound, Angry, Funny, Spiritual, Atheistic, Uncertain, Personal, Political, Mythic, Earthy,
and Only Occasionally Morbid. You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. As long as we
know about how is important a book Death Poems: Classic, Contemporary, Witty, Serious, Tear-Jerking,
Wise, Profound, Angry, Funny, Spiritual, Atheistic, Uncertain, Personal, Political, Mythic, Earthy, and Only
Occasionally Morbid. You can add expertise and of course you can around the world with a book.
Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can realize everything! From your country until finally
foreign or abroad you will find yourself known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you can know
that. In this era, we can open a book or perhaps searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You need
to use it when you feel uninterested to go to the library. Let's read.

Kathryn Richardson:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their
family, or their very own friends. Usually they carrying out activity like watching television, planning to
beach, or picnic within the park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something
different to fill your current free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book could be option to fill your totally
free time/ holiday. The first thing that you will ask may be what kinds of e-book that you should read. If you
want to attempt look for book, may be the e-book untitled Death Poems: Classic, Contemporary, Witty,
Serious, Tear-Jerking, Wise, Profound, Angry, Funny, Spiritual, Atheistic, Uncertain, Personal, Political,
Mythic, Earthy, and Only Occasionally Morbid can be fine book to read. May be it might be best activity to
you.

Terra Runyan:

This Death Poems: Classic, Contemporary, Witty, Serious, Tear-Jerking, Wise, Profound, Angry, Funny,
Spiritual, Atheistic, Uncertain, Personal, Political, Mythic, Earthy, and Only Occasionally Morbid is great
publication for you because the content which can be full of information for you who have always deal with
world and possess to make decision every minute. This book reveal it info accurately using great organize
word or we can say no rambling sentences inside. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole info in
it. Doesn't mean it only provides you with straight forward sentences but tricky core information with
beautiful delivering sentences. Having Death Poems: Classic, Contemporary, Witty, Serious, Tear-Jerking,
Wise, Profound, Angry, Funny, Spiritual, Atheistic, Uncertain, Personal, Political, Mythic, Earthy, and Only
Occasionally Morbid in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous just one.
We can say that no guide that offer you world throughout ten or fifteen second right but this publication
already do that. So , this is certainly good reading book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt that
will?



Wendell Holloway:

Many people said that they feel fed up when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item when they
get a half elements of the book. You can choose the book Death Poems: Classic, Contemporary, Witty,
Serious, Tear-Jerking, Wise, Profound, Angry, Funny, Spiritual, Atheistic, Uncertain, Personal, Political,
Mythic, Earthy, and Only Occasionally Morbid to make your personal reading is interesting. Your own
personal skill of reading skill is developing when you like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to
make you enjoy to read it and mingle the impression about book and examining especially. It is to be 1st
opinion for you to like to open up a book and study it. Beside that the book Death Poems: Classic,
Contemporary, Witty, Serious, Tear-Jerking, Wise, Profound, Angry, Funny, Spiritual, Atheistic, Uncertain,
Personal, Political, Mythic, Earthy, and Only Occasionally Morbid can to be your brand-new friend when
you're experience alone and confuse with the information must you're doing of this time.
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