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Transatlantic relations underwent significant change throughout the 1960s and 1970s as post-1945
cooperation was gradually replaced by rivalry in the economic, defence and intelligence arenas. An
increasingly vulnerable United States economy, together with a focus on detente, led the Nixon
Administration to adopt policies which directly challenged European economic and security concerns.
However, this was also the time when inter-allied relations experienced significant rejuvenation. The rise of
conservativism in the United States, no less than the debacle in Vietnam, augured new foreign policy
priorities for American leaders. Coinciding with the renewed focus on economic liberalism on both sides of
the Atlantic, the influence of conservatives in redefining international relations became increasingly obvious.
Drawing on recently declassified documents, 'Reform and Renewal' offers a detailed analysis of the major
events and themes in the transatlantic relationship. Focusing on the post-1960 era - a distinct phase in the
transatlantic relationship - it provides an examination of the interplay between domestic political factors and
the broader structural factors shaping relations between the United States and the countries of Western
Europe. Providing a comparative perspective on key initiatives such as the Year of Europe, this edited
collection will greatly enhance the existing literature in the field.
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From reader reviews:

Manuel Coury:

The book Reform and Renewal: Transatlantic Relations During the 1960s and 1970s can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Exactly why must we leave the best thing like a
book Reform and Renewal: Transatlantic Relations During the 1960s and 1970s? Several of you have a
different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give many information for us. It is absolutely
correct. Right now, try to closer with the book. Knowledge or data that you take for that, it is possible to give
for each other; you could share all of these. Book Reform and Renewal: Transatlantic Relations During the
1960s and 1970s has simple shape but you know: it has great and massive function for you. You can
appearance the enormous world by wide open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Keith Devine:

This Reform and Renewal: Transatlantic Relations During the 1960s and 1970s book is not ordinary book,
you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you obtain by reading this book will be
information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper you actually read a
lot of information you will get. That Reform and Renewal: Transatlantic Relations During the 1960s and
1970s without we recognize teach the one who examining it become critical in imagining and analyzing.
Don't possibly be worry Reform and Renewal: Transatlantic Relations During the 1960s and 1970s can bring
once you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' become full because you can have it in the
lovely laptop even cell phone. This Reform and Renewal: Transatlantic Relations During the 1960s and
1970s having great arrangement in word as well as layout, so you will not experience uninterested in reading.

Grace Seals:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like reading
book and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a publication will give you a lot of
new info. When you read a book you will get new information since book is one of many ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, examining a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially hype book the author will bring one to imagine the story how the people do it
anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read this Reform and Renewal:
Transatlantic Relations During the 1960s and 1970s, it is possible to tells your family, friends in addition to
soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them reading a publication.

Michael Wheeler:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
proficiency or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as
compared to can satisfy your small amount of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only
find publication that need more time to be examine. Reform and Renewal: Transatlantic Relations During the



1960s and 1970s can be your answer as it can be read by you actually who have those short free time
problems.
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